
In providing University of East Anglia images, text, information, content or 
other material for UEA Gigs (“Material”), and or submitting, posting or 
displaying Material on our social media channels including but not limited to 
Facebook pages @ueaofficial, @ueaalumni and Twitter account 
@UEAGighistory you grant University of East Anglia without charge, an 
irrevocable, perpetual, non-exclusive, worldwide and royalty-free licence (with 
the right to sublicense), to use, copy, reproduce, process, adapt, modify, 
publish, transmit, display and distribute the Material in any and all media or 
distribution methods now known or later developed together with a right to 
credit you as provider of the Material. You declare that you have the right 
power and authority to enter into this agreement, that to the best of your 
knowledge and belief that that the Material is original work and has not been 
copied wholly or substantially from any other source, that you are the owner 
of the intellectual property in the Material, that the use by University of East 
Anglia of the Material will not infringe the rights of any third party and that you 
will defend and hold University of East Anglia harmless from any and all claims 
arising therefrom. 

Data Protection ACT 1998. The Data Controller is the University of East Anglia. 
Contact information you supply will only be used to contact you regarding the 
Material and or to credit you as provider of the Material. The University of East 
Anglia does not sell or otherwise transfer personal data to any third parties 
without consent or unless required by law. 

 


